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INFINITY FILM FESTIVAL’S PROGRAMMING ON SUNDAY, NOVEMBER 4TH 

FEATURES SPECIAL SCREENING EVENT: DAVE NAVARRO PRESENTS 
MOURNING SON, A FILM BY TODD NEWMAN 

 
Q&A with Guitar Icon Navarro and Director Newman, Moderated by  
Renowned Publisher Judith Regan and Fast Company’s KC Ifeanyi  

Immediately Following the Screening 
 
 
Beverly Hills, CA—October 29, 2018 — The inaugural Infinity Film Festival (IFF) will 
feature a special screening event of Dave Navarro Presents Mourning Son, a film by Todd 
Newman, on Sunday, November 4. The documentary, which tells the tragic story of 
Navarro’s mother’s murder, will screen at RealD Theater at 100 North Crescent Drive in 
Beverly Hills at 4:30 p.m. PT. Immediately following, there will be a question-and-answer 
session with Navarro and director Newman, to be moderated by media personality Judith 
Regan and KC Ifeanyi of Fast Company. 
 
In Mourning Son, the Jane's Addiction guitarist opens up about the tragic murder of 
Constance Navarro, and her friend, Sue Jory, who were brutally murdered on March 3, 1983, 
by Constance’s ex-boyfriend, John Riccardi. For eight years the killer eluded capture while 
Navarro dealt with his trauma and fear through drugs, art and escapism. Mourning Son 
focuses on the true story of what really happened to Navarro’s mother and the repercussions 
of her death. The film was written by Navarro and director Newman, and was produced by 
Navarro, Newman and Larissa Swan. 
 
“This was a subject matter that was very close to our hearts and needed to be told just right – 
ultimately taking seven years to make,” said Newman. “Through Mourning Son, Dave was 
finally able to find a vehicle to open up about the tragedy that occurred to him when he was 
15. We are honored to screen this film at IFF and hope it will continue to open lines of 
communication for those who have endured painful situations.” 
 



In addition to the Mourning Son special screening event on the final day of the IFF, 
festivalgoers will have the opportunity to immerse themselves in other programming 
including the HULU sneak preview of Zen Dog and the behind-the-scenes short Zen Dog: On 
the Road at the Laemmle Music Hall (includes Q&A session with director Rick Darge and 
producer Chadwick Dunn); CW presents All American (Q&A session with actors Michael 
Evans Bahling and Daniel Ezra, producer/writer Nkechi O’Carroll and moderated by Fast 
Company’s KC Ifeanyi) and EPIX presents Berlin Station (Q&A session with 
actor/director/writer Leland Orser and writer/producer Jason Horwitch, moderated by Fast 
Company’s KC Ifeanyi) both at the Writers Guild Theater. The IFF will also be featuring the 
world premiere of The Chemical Era VR Experience from Veronica Flint at the Writers 
Guild Theater. 
 
“We are so excited to have Mourning Son screen at IFF,” said co-founder Mark Lieber. “This 
is a very personal story that Dave and Todd have put on the big screen and we know that the 
Q&A with Judith Regan and KC Ifeanyi will be very compelling.” 
 
For tickets and additional information (including a complete schedule) visit 
https://www.infinityfilmfestival.com/tickets 
 
 
 
About Infinity Film Festival  
Infinity Film Festival in Beverly Hills celebrates story advanced by technology and invites 
participants to experience unique moments in time in the entertainment capital of the world. 
Festival blockchain integrations will be providing responsive, transparent and clear value 
exchanges between innovators, creators, fans and brands. Programming has an emerging-
technology focus, with events bringing together creative, business and tech icons 
from Hollywood, Silicon Valley and Silicon Beach. The festival is inspired by the seemingly 
infinite possibilities currently being realized in content and technology. The event's venues 
include the Paley Center for Media, the Writers Guild Theater, Laemmle's Music Hall and 
RealD Theater. 
 
 

 
#  #  

 
 


